I 4. ST.ud.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

I1.50.-21.Te.-31.-01072022-23 6981
CG-DL-E-01072022-236981

ETITIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | |—E7e 3—37-97% (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 472] 7 oA, EFATR, s 1, 2022/ S9TE 10, 1944
No. 472] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, JULY 1, 2022/ASHADHA 10, 1944
UEREIER]

TE faeett, 1 518, 2022

T, 506(3).—FarT Teae, el i (RfFeme) sfafa=w, 2010 (2010 #1 42) #
#TT 48 FIT T& TRRAT &1 TN 3 gy, et srtvam (Rfaawe) M=, 2011 #7 &7 dees w2 &
oo Mo e aamd 2, srarfa-

1. Hferg A 3T T —(1) = i &7 "ter 9w Beeft stvem (R dearae B,
2022 % |

(2) T TSI § 3ok THTLA T TG FT TIT Z9T|
2. faeft srferam (RFR=we) Raw, 2011 (PE =98 =95 T2md 356 Ao w21 @ 2) & w6 #,—
(i) “TeF TG FIA” 9Teal F T UL “TH AT FqF” 968 ¥ STUAT;
(ii) “rer fo=t” ersai o T 9% AT "EY 9Te] T STUAT;
3. 3 o & e 9 4,
(i) IUFRTT (1) F ©T (F) ¥, “Iug A aeai F w9 o2 “Gareig o’ eres T S0,
(ii) IURTHT (2) F ©T (T) H, “Iug o a=ai & e 92 “Gareii G ores T o,
4. 3<% et % e 13 % @ (@) &1 o T sroem)
5. I et o Few 175 ¥, “dug e asai & = u) “dareie faq” eres v oo,

4453 G1/2022 @)




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

6.

feoqur

I Rt & A 20 ®, 9T RS 927 9Teal T UT ‘T Y& gigd UH IEy 3fi¥ ff
", ST e g g fAfafEe & smu” ores @@ srom

[T, . 11/21022/23(04)/2021-TFer=me-111]

Ao, Tom, AR (TEEteT)

I a9 aa & o9, JE e, 9 |, g2 3, SUEs (i) § AfeEHr qedid 9.
349(37), aTaE 29 e, 2011 FTRT THTAa f3Fw 10 3 sie qewsma |, 292 (31), ardw
12 =191, 2012, 91.%1.4. 966 (31), ar@ 14 fewwa<, 2015, AT.#.F. 199 (31), @ 7 AT,
2019, AT.#1.57. 659 (31), A 16 daw, 2019, A1.%1.M. 695(37), A 10 Faa<, 2020 FRT
A gt aFLM. 17(30), a1 S9ast, 2021 g7 gentea &3 T |

MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 1st July, 2022
G.S.R. 506(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 48 of the Foreign Contribution

(Regulation) Act, 2010 (42 of 2010), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to
amend the Foreign Contribution (Regulation) Rules, 2011, namely:-

1.

Short title and commencement—(1) These rules may be called the Foreign Contribution

(Regulation) Amendment Rules, 2022.

2.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
In the Foreign Contribution (Regulation) Rules, 2011 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in

rule 6, —

Note :

(1) for the words “one lakh rupees”, the words “ten lakh rupees” shall be substituted;
(ii) for the words “thirty days”, the words “three months™ shall be substituted;
In the said rules, in rule 9,

(i) in sub-rule (1), in clause (e), for the words “fifteen days”, the words “forty five days” shall be
substituted;

(ii) in sub-rule (2), in clause (e), for the words “fifteen days”, the words “forty five days” shall be
substituted:;

In the said rules, in rule 13, clause (b) shall be omitted.

In the said rules, in rule 17A, for the words “fifteen days”, the words “forty five days” shall be
substituted:;

In the said rules, in rule 20, for the words “on a plain paper”, the words “in such form and manner,
including in electronic form as may be specified by the Central Government” shall be substituted.

[F. No. 11/21022/23(04)/2021-FCRA-I1II]
V.S. RANA, Director (FCRA)

The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part Il, Section 3, Sub-
section (i), vide notification number G.S.R. 349(E), dated the 29™ April, 2011 and subsequently
amended, vide G.S.R. 292 (E), dated the 12th April, 2012, G.S.R. 966 (E), dated the 14th
December, 2015, G.S.R. 199 (E), dated the 7th March, 2019, G.S.R. 659 (E), dated the 16th
September, 2019, G.S.R. 695(E), dated the 10th November, 2020 and a Corrigendum vide G.S.R.
17(E), dated the 11" January, 2021.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.  wmanoskumar ”

VERMA




		2022-07-01T23:29:40+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




